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UNDERTAKING OF COUNSEL 

TO THE COMMISSION OF THE WALKERTON INQUIRY 
 
I undertake to the Commission of the Walkerton Inquiry that any and all documents or 
information which are produced to me in connection with the Commission’s proceedings 
will not be used by me for any purpose other than those proceedings.  I further undertake 
that I will not disclose any such documents or information to anyone for whom I do not 
act, and to anyone for whom I act only upon the individual in question giving the written 
undertaking annexed hereto.  In the event I act for a coalition, I will disclose such 
documents and information to anyone who is a member of that coalition only upon the 
individual in question giving the written undertaking annexed hereto. 
 
I understand that this undertaking has no force or effect once any such document or 
information has become part of the public proceedings of the Commission, or to the 
extent that the Commissioner may release me from the undertaking with respect to any 
document or information.  For greater certainty, a document is only part of the public 
proceedings once the document is made an exhibit at the Inquiry. 
 
With respect to those documents or information which remain subject to this undertaking 
at the end of the Inquiry, I undertake to either destroy those documents or information, 
and provide a certificate of destruction to the Commission, or to return those documents 
to the Commission for destruction.  I further undertake to collect for destruction such 
documents or information from anyone to whom I have disclosed any documents or 
information which were produced to me in connection with the Commission’s 
proceedings. 
 
 
 
_______________________   ________________________ 
Signature     Witness 
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SUPPLEMENTARY UNDERTAKING OF COUNSEL 

TO THE COMMISSION OF THE WALKERTON INQUIRY 
WITH RESPECT TO EXPERTS 

 
I undertake to the Commission of the Walkerton Inquiry that any and all documents or 
information which are produced to me in connection with the Commission’s proceedings 
will not be used by me for any purpose other than those proceedings.  I further undertake 
that I will not disclose any such documents or information to anyone for whom I do not 
act or who has not been retained as an expert for the purposes of the Inquiry.  In respect 
of anyone for whom I act or any expert retained for the purposes of the Inquiry, I further 
undertake that I will disclose any such documents or information only upon the 
individual in question giving the appropriate written undertaking annexed hereto.  In the 
event I act for a coalition, I will disclose such documents and information to anyone who 
is a member of that coalition only upon the individual in question giving the written 
undertaking annexed hereto. 
 
I understand that this undertaking has no force or effect once any such document or 
information has become part of the public proceedings of the Commission, or to the 
extent that the Commissioner may release me from the undertaking with respect to any 
document or information.  For greater certainty, a document is only part of the public 
proceedings once the document is made an exhibit at the Inquiry. 
 
With respect to those documents or information which remain subject to this undertaking 
at the end of the Inquiry, I undertake to either destroy those documents or information, 
and provide a certificate of destruction to the Commission, or to return those documents 
to the Commission for destruction.  I further undertake to collect for destruction such 
documents or information from anyone to whom I have disclosed any documents or 
information which were produced to me in connection with the Commission’s 
proceedings. 
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UNDERTAKING OF PARTIES 

TO THE COMMISSION OF THE WALKERTON INQUIRY 
 
I undertake to the Commission of the Walkerton Inquiry that any and all documents or 
information which are produced to me in connection with the Commission’s proceedings 
will not be used by me for any purpose other than those proceedings.  I further undertake 
that I will not disclose any such documentation or information to anyone. 
  
I understand that this undertaking will have no force or effect with respect to any 
document or information which becomes part of the public proceedings of the 
Commission, or to the extent that the Commissioner may release me from the 
undertaking with respect to any document or information.  For greater certainty, a 
document is only part of the public proceedings once the document is made an exhibit at 
the Inquiry. 
 
With respect to those documents or information which remain subject to this undertaking 
at the end of the Inquiry, I further understand that such documents or information will be 
collected from me by the person acting as my counsel who disclosed them to me. 
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UNDERTAKING OF EXPERTS 

TO THE COMMISSION OF THE WALKERTON INQUIRY 
 
I undertake to the Commission of the Walkerton Inquiry that any and all documents or 
information which are produced to me in connection with the Commission’s proceedings 
will not be used by me for any purpose other than those proceedings.  I further undertake 
that I will not disclose any such documentation or information to anyone. 
  
I understand that this undertaking will have no force or effect with respect to any 
document or information which becomes part of the public proceedings of the 
Commission, or to the extent that the Commissioner may release me from the 
undertaking with respect to any document or information.  For greater certainty, a 
document is only part of the public proceedings once the document is made an exhibit at 
the Inquiry. 
 
With respect to those documents or information which remain subject to this undertaking 
at the end of the Inquiry, I further understand that such documents or information will be 
collected from me by the person acting as counsel who disclosed them to me. 
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